
YOUR ENCHANTING 
WEDDING DAY IN THE  
WILD ATLANTIC WAY



PERFECTION IS OUR 
GUARANTEE...

“Sandy toes and salty kisses” 
UNKNOWN

Congratulations to you both at such an 
exciting time in your life. In choosing the 
award winning Broadhaven Bay Hotel, 
you will experience a combination of 
successful elements which ensure that 
your very special celebration receives 
nothing less than the perfect backdrop 
and enthusiastic attention it deserves. 

It starts with our incredible ocean views 
and continues with a truly dedicated and 
experienced team of professionals who 
will ensure your tailormade wedding day 
turns into the wonderful reality you have 
always dreamed of...



A WARM WELCOME 
AWAITS...

Our wedding planner will work closely 
with you and together with the hotels 
extended management team promise to 
create a magical wedding day experience 
for you. We have a wide range of creative 
menu options and reception themes to 
choose from and delight in the opportunity 
of extending a warm welcome to you and 
your wedding guests as you arrive to the 
welcoming ambiance of the Foyer at the 
Broadhaven Bay Hotel.



YOUR BRIDAL PARTY 
AND GUESTS ARE 
ALSO OUR GUESTS

Our spectacular ocean front setting is 
yours to savour as you create memories 
to treasure forever from your wedding 
day. This incredible location is the ideal 
setting in which we will professionally 
cater for intimate and larger weddings, 
civil cermonies and humanist blessings. 
This is the day you have waited for. Make 
every moment count. Welcome to the 
Broadhaven Bay Hotel.


